
 

 

Freedom of Information Request FOI 22 27 
  

Deliberate Fires 
 
 

Query and Response: 
  
This is a request under the Freedom of Information Act for data on deliberate fires. 
Please provide for your service: 

1. How many deliberate fires have been recorded for the years: 2018, 2019, 
2020, 2021, 2022? 

Please find the attached excel sheet for detail (FOI 22 27 - Deliberate 
Fires by Year). 

  
2. How many fires have been flagged as a result of anti-social behaviour for the 

years: 2018, 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022? 

We are unable to answer this question as we do not record if the fire 
was due to anti-social behaviour 

  
3. How many fires have been flagged as a result of anti-social behaviour for the 

years for the last four years broken down by quarter? 

We are unable to answer this question as we do not record if the fire 
was due to anti-social behaviour 

  
i.e: 
2018/19 Apr, May, Jun 
2018/19 Jul, Aug, Sep 
2018/19 Oct, Nov, Dec 
2018/19 Jan, Feb, Mar 
2019/20 Apr, May, Jun 
2019/20 Jul, Aug, Sep 
2019/20 Oct, Nov, Dec 
2019/20 Jan, Feb, Mar 
2020/21 Apr, May, Jun 
2020/21 Jul, Aug, Sep 
2020/21 Oct, Nov, Dec 
2020/21 Jan, Feb, Mar 
2021/22 Apr, May, Jun 
2021/22 Jul, Aug, Sep 
2021/22 Oct, Nov, Dec 
2021/22 Jan, Feb, Mar 

 
 

Information/Detail accurate on the date provided: 11, April 2022   


