

# Freedom of Information Request FOI 20 85

## Waking watches and temporary alarm systems

#### Query and response:

1. How many 'waking watches' are in currently place in residential buildings in your area due to flammable cladding or other fire safety defects

#### Five

a. How many of these buildings are over 18m

Five – we do not record building height in metres, so our answer includes buildings of five storeys and more as the nearest alternative

b. How many of these buildings are between 11m and 18m

#### Zero

2. How many buildings in your area have had temporary alarm systems installed over the last year due to flammable cladding or other fire safety defects

### Three

a. How many of these buildings are over 18m

Three – we do not record building height in metres, so our answer includes buildings of five storeys and more as the nearest alternative

b. How many of these buildings are between 11m and 18m

Zero

Information/Detail accurate on the date provided: 18, November 2020

